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A celebration of innovation

The achievement of something that is 
radically new, that has never been 
reached before, is in itself a fascinat-
ing experience. At ABB, this is even 
more so if the new idea can open up 
real advantages for customers or soci-
ety as a whole. Hundreds of scientists 
and engineers in ABB’s corporate 
 research centers and in the divisions 
across the globe are continuously 
 pursuing such innovations, many of 
which will define the products and 
 applications of tomorrow. 

Every year, the fourth edition of ABB 
Review is dedicated to presenting the 
best innovations of that year. Selecting 
these is no easy task and those finally 
selected represent only a cross section 
of what has been achieved.

One such technological innovation is 
shown in the picture above: a control 
panel of Busch-priOn® – part of the 
 intelligent room-control concept devel-
oped by Busch-Jaeger, a member of 
the ABB Group. The luminescent aura 
of this panel looks like a futuristic 
 design in itself, but there is more to 
it than first meets the eye: The color 
actually changes dependent on the 
context (the aspect being controlled), 
leveraging an intuitive and easy-to-
understand  approach to a powerful 
multifunctional interface. This concept 
was awarded the internationally re-
nowned “red dot design award” for its 
innovation in communication design.
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